

Marlboro Township  
 Bid # 2024-05 Water Meters  
 Wednesday, February 14, 2024 @ 10:00am

Ferguson  
 507 Oak Glen Road  
 Howell, NJ 07731

Core & Main  
 5142 Hurley Pond Road  
 Farmingdale, NJ 07727

NO.	ITEM	QTY*	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
<b>Water Meters</b>							
1	5/8" X 3/4" (7.5" Length) Transit-Time Residential Cold Water Meter Flow Measurement (Sensus iPerl Meters, Master Meter Sonata or Equal)	50	Ea.	\$131.59	\$6,579.50	No Bid	No Bid
2	3/4" X 3/4" (7.5" Length) Transit-Time Residential Cold Water Meter Flow Measurement (Sensus iPerl Meters, Master Meter Sonata or Equal)	50	Ea.	\$146.66	\$7,333.00	No Bid	No Bid
3	1" X 1" Transit-Time Residential Cold Water Meter Flow Measurement (Sensus iPerl Meters, Master Meter Sonata or Equal)	50	Ea.	\$203.67	\$10,183.50	No Bid	No Bid
4	5/8" X 3/4" (7.5" Length) ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	50	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$155.00	\$7,750.00
5	3/4" X 3/4" (7.5" Length) ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	50	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	\$8,750.00
6	3/4" X 3/4" (7.5" Length) ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT with metallic lead free threads (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	50	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00	\$9,750.00
7	1" X 1" ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	50	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$240.00	\$12,000.00
8	1" X 1" ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT with metallic lead free threads (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	50	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$255.00	\$12,750.00
9	1.5" Ultrasonic Commercial & Industrial Water Meter (Sensus iPerl Meters, Sensus CordoneL or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,765.00	\$1,765.00
10	2" Ultrasonic Commercial & Industrial Water Meter (Sensus iPerl Meters, Sensus CordoneL or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,033.00	\$2,033.00
11	4" Ultrasonic Commercial & Industrial Water Meter (Sensus iPerl Meters, Sensus CordoneL or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,444.00	\$4,444.00
12	1.5" Omni C2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,405.00	\$1,405.00
13	2" Omni C2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,625.00	\$1,625.00
14	4" Omni C2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,575.00	\$3,575.00
15	6" Omni C2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$6,095.00	\$6,095.00
16	8" Omni C2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$9,315.00	\$9,315.00
17	10" Omni C2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00
18	1.5" Omni T2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$900.00	\$900.00
19	2" Omni T2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$920.00	\$920.00
20	4" Omni T2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,590.00	\$2,590.00
21	6" Omni T2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,675.00	\$4,675.00
22	8" Omni T2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$7,915.00	\$7,915.00
23	10" Omni T2 ELECTROMAGNETIC FLOW MEASUREMENT (Sensus iPerl Meters or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$10,325.00	\$10,325.00
24	Sensus Water Meter Pit TRPL Conversion Wire 6'	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.00	\$20.00
25	Sensus Water Meter Pit TRPL Conversion Wire 25'	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$36.00	\$36.00
<b>MXU / Accessories</b>							
26	Sensus MXU Units or Equal (Model 510M single port or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$165.00	\$165.00
27	Sensus MXU Units or Equal (Model 510M dual port or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$220.00	\$220.00
28	Sensus MXU Units or Equal (Model 520M single port TR/PL or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$170.00	\$170.00
29	Sensus MXU Units or Equal (Model 520M dual port TR/PL or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$225.00	\$225.00
30	Handheld Device (Sensus 7502 or Equal)***	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$12,185.00	\$12,185.00
31	Touch Gun with charger (Sensus 4090 or Equal)	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,400.00	\$1,400.00
32	Sensus Command Link for MXU Programming	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$675.00	\$675.00
33	Sensus Touch Pad or Equal	5	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.00	\$100.00
34	WIRE CONNECTORS - GELCAP BUTTSPlice 22-26 AWG - YELLOW - 2 WIRE - GEL FILLED	1000	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$25.00	\$250.00
35	Sensus Omni Replacement Electronic Communications Register 1.5"-10"	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$405.00	\$405.00
36	VXU Unit (Sensus or Equal)****	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$23,000.00	\$23,000.00
<b>Meter Washers / Gaskets / Hardware</b>							
37	3/4" EPDM Water Meter Washers	1000	Ea.	\$0.54	\$540.00	\$1.25	\$1,250.00
38	1" EPDM Water Meter Washers	1000	Ea.	\$0.57	\$570.00	\$1.50	\$1,500.00
39	1.5" EPDM Full Flange Water Meter Gasket	2	Ea.	\$4.65	\$9.30	\$8.00	\$16.00
40	2" EPDM Full Flange Water Meter Gasket	2	Ea.	\$5.26	\$10.52	\$10.00	\$20.00
41	4" EPDM Full Flange Water Meter Gasket	2	Ea.	\$55.79	\$111.58	\$30.00	\$60.00
42	6" EPDM Full Flange Water Meter Gasket	2	Ea.	\$110.63	\$221.26	\$44.00	\$88.00
43	8" EPDM Full Flange Water Meter Gasket	2	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$65.00	\$130.00
44	10" EPDM Full Flange Water Meter Gasket	2	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$75.00	\$150.00
45	1.5" Meter Installation Hardware Stainless Steel Bolt Pack	1	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$33.00	\$33.00
46	2" Meter Installation Hardware Stainless Steel Bolt Pack	1	Ea.	\$17.80	\$17.80	\$50.00	\$50.00
47	4" Meter Installation Hardware Stainless Steel Bolt Pack	1	Ea.	\$35.45	\$35.45	\$115.00	\$115.00
48	6" Meter Installation Hardware Stainless Steel Bolt Pack	1	Ea.	\$55.88	\$55.88	\$186.00	\$186.00
49	8" Meter Installation Hardware Stainless Steel Bolt Pack	1	Ea.	\$59.10	\$59.10	\$186.00	\$186.00
50	10" Meter Installation Hardware Stainless Steel Bolt Pack	1	Ea.	\$168.10	\$168.10	\$535.00	\$535.00
51	3/4" EPDM Beveled Type Compression Fitting Washer	1000	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
52	3/4" EPDM Water Meter Compression Yoke Washers	1000	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
53	1" EPDM Beveled Type Compression Fitting Washer	1000	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
54	1" EPDM Water Meter Compression Yoke Washers	1000	Ea.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>					<b>\$25,894.99</b>	<b>\$163,752.00</b>	