Bid 2022B - WMPG -
Various Road and

Walter R. Earle Corp

Stavola Construction Materials, Inc.

American Bituminous Company Inc.

Trap Rock Industries LLC

1800 Route 34, Bld 2, Suite 205

175 Drift Road

100 Main Street

PO Box 419

Wall, NJ 07719

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

West Collingswood Hgts, NJ 08059

Kingston, NJ 08528

Will not extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

(D)| (E)QTY x (E) QTY x (E) QTY x (E) QTY x
DESCRIPTION- (A)|(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. TOTAL TOTAL/| (B) UNIT| (C)DEL. %gl}ﬁg TOTAL|(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. %;;?g?; TOTAL|(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. %gl}ﬁg TOTAL
# |MATERIALS TO BE|| UNIT| EST BID PRICE| UNIT BID| BID INCL BID PRICE m BID INCL BID PRICE m BID INCL BID PRICE m BID INCL
DELIVERED QTY| PRICE*|PER UNIT PRICE| DELIVERY| PRICE*|PER UNIT W DELIVER| PRICE*|PER UNIT W DELIVER| PRICE*|PER UNIT W DELIVER
(B+C) (AxD) Y (AxD) Y (AxD) Y (AxD)
HOT MIX
ASPHALT
1|SURFACE COURSE || Tons
Marlboro 5,000 - - - - - - - - - - - -
Freehold Borough 100 . - - - . - - - . - - - . - - -
Freehold Township 2.000 No Bid - . . No Bid - . . No Bid - - - No Bid . - -
Manalapan 20,000 - - - - - - - - - - - -
HOT MIX
ASPHALT BASE
2|COURSE Tons
Marlboro 2,500 - - - - - - - - - - - -
Freehold Borough 50 . - - - . - - - . - - - . - - -
Freehold Township 2.000 No Bid - . . No Bid - . . No Bid - - - No Bid . - -
Manalapan 1,000 - - - - - - - - - - - -
3 BITUMINOUS
COLD PATCH Tons
Marlboro 150 - - - $15.00 $175.00{ $26,250.00 $15.00 $155.00] $23,250.00 $8.00 $188.00{ $28,200.00
Freehold Borough 200 . - - - $15.00 $175.00] $35,000.00 $15.00 $155.00] $31,000.00 $8.00 $188.00] $37,600.00
Freehold Township 100 No Bid - - - $160.00 $15.00 $175.00] $17,500.00 $140.00 $15.00 $155.00] $15,500.00 $180.00 $8.00 $188.00] $18,800.00
Manalapan 100 - - - $15.00 $175.00] $17,500.00 $15.00 $155.00] $15,500.00 $7.00 $187.00] $18,700.00
TAC COAT
4| EMULSION Gals
Marlboro 500 - - - - - - - - - - - -
Freehold Borough . - - - . - - - . - - - . - - -
Freehold Township 100 No Bid - . . No Bid - . . No Bid - - - No Bid . - -
Manalapan 500 - - - - - - - - - - - -




Bid 2022B - WMPG -
Various Road and

Walter R. Earle Corp

Stavola Construction Materials, Inc.

American Bituminous Company Inc.

Trap Rock Industries LLC

1800 Route 34, Bld 2, Suite 205

175 Drift Road

100 Main Street

PO Box 419

Wall, NJ 07719

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

West Collingswood Hgts, NJ 08059

Kingston, NJ 08528

Will not extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

(B33

DESCRIPTION-
MATERIALS TO BE

UNIT

(A)]
EST

O (E)QTY x

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. TOTAL TOTAL

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

BID PRICE| UNIT BID| BID INCL

UNIT BID LOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

UNIT BID LOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

UNIT BID TOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

DELIVERED

QTY

PRICE*|PER UNIT PRICE| DELIVERY

PRICE*|PER UNIT

PRICE*|PER UNIT

PRICE*|PER UNIT

(B+C) (AxD)

DELIVER
+
B+C Y (AxD)

DELIVER
+
B+C Y (AxD)

DELIVER
| DELIVER
B+C Y (AxD)

RESERVED

HOT MIX
ASPHALT
INTERMEDIATE

Tons

Marlboro

Freehold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

2,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

BITUMINOUS
CONCRETE TYPE
CURB MIX

Tons

Marlboro

Freechold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

HIGH
PERFORMANCE
COLD PATCH

Tons

Marlboro

250

Freehold Borough

80

Freehold Township

Manalapan

No Bid

$15.00 $175.00( $43,750.00

$160.00 $15.00]  $175.00] $14,000.00

No Bid

No Bid




Bid 2022B - WMPG -
Various Road and

Walter R. Earle Corp

Stavola Construction Materials, Inc.

American Bituminous Company Inc.

Trap Rock Industries LLC

1800 Route 34, Bld 2, Suite 205

175 Drift Road

100 Main Street

PO Box 419

Wall, NJ 07719

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

West Collingswood Hgts, NJ 08059

Kingston, NJ 08528

Will not extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

(B33

DESCRIPTION-
MATERIALS TO BE

UNIT

(A)]
EST

O (E)QTY x

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. TOTAL TOTAL

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

BID PRICE| UNIT BID| BID INCL

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

UNIT BID LOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

UNIT BID LOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

UNIT BID TOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

DELIVERED

QTY

PRICE*|PER UNIT PRICE| DELIVERY

PRICE*|PER UNIT

(B+CO) (AxD)

PRICE*|PER UNIT

PRICE*|PER UNIT

DELIVER
+
B0 "y (axD)

DELIVER
+
B+C Y (AxD)

DELIVER
| DELIVER
B0 "y (axD)

8b

HIGH
PERFORMANCE
COLD PATCH 50 Ib
bags

Bag

Marlboro

Freehold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

100

No Bid

No Bid

$21.00

$3,100.00

No Bid

RESERVED

10

SAND (ICE

Tons

Marlboro

1,000

Freehold Borough

200

Freehold Township

1,000

Manalapan

200

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1

—_—

SOIL AGGREGATE
TYPE 5, CLASS A

Tons

Marlboro

Freechold Borough

500

Freehold Township

Manalapan

No Bid

$23.00 $31.25] $15,625.00

No Bid

No Bid

12

ROAD
GRAVEL/BANK
RUN GRAVEL

Marlboro

Freechold Borough

Freehold Township

500

Manalapan

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




Bid 2022B - WMPG -
Various Road and

Walter R. Earle Corp

Stavola Construction Materials, Inc.

American Bituminous Company Inc.

Trap Rock Industries LLC

1800 Route 34, Bld 2, Suite 205

175 Drift Road

100 Main Street

PO Box 419

Wall, NJ 07719

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

West Collingswood Hgts, NJ 08059

Kingston, NJ 08528

Will not extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

(B33

DESCRIPTION-
MATERIALS TO BE

UNIT

(A)]
EST

O (E)QTY x

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. TOTAL TOTAL

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

BID PRICE| UNIT BID| BID INCL

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

UNIT BID LOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

UNIT BID LOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

UNIT BID TOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

DELIVERED

QTY

PRICE*|PER UNIT PRICE| DELIVERY

PRICE*|PER UNIT

(B+C) (AxD)

PRICE*|PER UNIT

PRICE*|PER UNIT

DELIVER
+
B+C Y (AxD)

DELIVER
+
B+C Y (AxD)

DELIVER
| DELIVER
B+C Y (AxD)

13

%" BROKEN
STONE

Tons

Marlboro

500

Freehold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

400

No Bid

$7.75 $15,375.00

$30.75

$23.00

$8.00 $31.00{ $12,400.00

No Bid

$8.00 $33.75] $16,875.00

$25.75

$7.00 $32.75] $13,100.00

14

17 AND 1 %
BROKEN STONE,

Tons

Marlboro

250

Freechold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

No Bid

$7.75 $32.75[ $8,187.50

$25.00

No Bid

$8.00 $36.50[ $9,125.00

$28.50

15

1” AND 2~
BROKEN STONE,
BLENDED

Tons

Marlboro

Freehold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

400

No Bid

$25.00

$8.00 $33.00{ $13,200.00

No Bid

$21.00

$28.00{ $11,200.00

16

SOIL AGGREGATE
NJDOT I-4 ROAD
GRAVEL

Marlboro

Freechold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

No Bid

$7.75 $31.75 -

$8.25 $32.25 -

$24.00

$8.25 $32.25 -

$8.00 $32.00 -

No Bid

No Bid




Bid 2022B - WMPG -
Various Road and

Walter R. Earle Corp

Stavola Construction Materials, Inc.

American Bituminous Company Inc.

Trap Rock Industries LLC

1800 Route 34, Bld 2, Suite 205

175 Drift Road

100 Main Street

PO Box 419

Wall, NJ 07719

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

West Collingswood Hgts, NJ 08059

Kingston, NJ 08528

Will not extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

(B33

DESCRIPTION-
MATERIALS TO BE

UNIT

(A)]
EST

O (E)QTY x

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. TOTAL TOTAL

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

BID PRICE| UNIT BID| BID INCL

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

UNIT BID LOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

DELIVERED

QTY

PRICE*|PER UNIT PRICE| DELIVERY

UNIT BID LOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

UNIT BID TOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

PRICE*|PER UNIT

(B+C) (AxD)

PRICE*|PER UNIT

PRICE*|PER UNIT

DELIVER
+
B+C Y (AxD)

DELIVER
+
B+C Y (AxD)

DELIVER
| DELIVER
B+C Y (AxD)

17

PEA GRAVEL

Marlboro

Freechold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

18A

RIP RAP STONE,
D50=8”

Tons

Marlboro

200

Freehold Borough

Freehold Township

200

Manalapan

400

No Bid

$8.25 $53.25] $10,650.00

$45.00

$8.75 $53.75] $10,750.00

$8.50 $53.50{ $21,400.00

No Bid

$10.00 $45.00] $9,000.00

$35.00

$9,000.00
$18,000.00

$45.00
$45.00

$10.00
$10.00

18B

RIP RAP STONE,
D50=15”

Tons

Marlboro

200

Freechold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

No Bid

$8.25 $63.25] $12,650.00

$55.00

No Bid

No Bid

19

TOP SOIL

Marlboro

Freechold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

20

CLEAN FILL DIRT

Tons

Marlboro

Freechold Borough

100

Freehold Township

Manalapan

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




Bid 2022B - WMPG -
Various Road and

Walter R. Earle Corp

Stavola Construction Materials, Inc.

American Bituminous Company Inc.

Trap Rock Industries LLC

1800 Route 34, Bld 2, Suite 205

175 Drift Road

100 Main Street

PO Box 419

Wall, NJ 07719

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

West Collingswood Hgts, NJ 08059

Kingston, NJ 08528

Will not extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

(B33

DESCRIPTION-
MATERIALS TO BE

UNIT

(A)]
EST

O (E)QTY x

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. TOTAL TOTAL

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

(D) TOTAL (E) QTY x|

(B) UNIT| (C)DEL.

BID PRICE| UNIT BID| BID INCL

UNIT BID LOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

UNIT BID LOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

UNIT BID TOTAL

BID PRICE PRICE BID INCL

DELIVERED

QTY

PRICE*|PER UNIT PRICE| DELIVERY

PRICE*|PER UNIT

PRICE*|PER UNIT

PRICE*|PER UNIT

(B+C) (AxD)

DELIVER
+
B+C Y (AxD)

DELIVER
+
B+C Y (AxD)

DELIVER
| DELIVER
B+C Y (AxD)

21

RESERVED

22

RESERVED

23

RESERVED

24

RESERVED

25

RESERVED

26

RESERVED

27

RESERVED

28

RESERVED

29

RESERVED

30

ROCK SALT

Tons

Marlboro

1,000

Freehold Borough

400

Freehold Township

4,500

Manalapan

500

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid*

3

—_—

LIQUID CALCIUM
CHOLORIDE

Gallons

Marlboro

Freehold Borough

Freehold Township

15,000

Manalapan

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid*




Bid 2022B - WMPG -
Various Road and

Walter R. Earle Corp

Stavola Construction Materials, Inc.

American Bituminous Company Inc.

Trap Rock Industries LLC

1800 Route 34, Bld 2, Suite 205

175 Drift Road

100 Main Street

PO Box 419

Wall, NJ 07719

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

West Collingswood Hgts, NJ 08059

Kingston, NJ 08528

Will not extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

(B33

DESCRIPTION-
MATERIALS TO BE

UNIT

(A)]
EST

(B) UNIT

(C) DEL.

(D)
TOTAL

(E) OTY x
TOTAL

(B) UNIT

(C) DEL.

BID

PRICE

UNIT BID

BID INCL

BID

PRICE

DELIVERED

QTY

PRICE*

PER UNIT

PRICE

DELIVERY

PRICE*

PER UNIT

(B+C)

(AxD)

(D) TOTAL
UNIT BID

PRICE
B+C

(E)QTY A
TOTAL

(B) UNIT

(C) DEL.

BID INCL

BID

PRICE

DELIVER

PRICE*

PER UNIT

Y (AxD)

D) TOTAL
UNIT BID)|

PRICE]
B+C

(E) QTY A
TOTAL

(B) UNIT

(C) DEL.

BID INCL

BID

PRICE

DELIVER

PRICE*

PER UNIT

Y (AxD)

D) TOTAL
UNIT BID)|

PRICE|
B+C

() QTY A
TOTAL

BID INCL|
DELIVER
Y (AxD)

32

PRE-MIXED ROCK
SALT SODIUM
CHLORIDE/CALCI
UM CHLORIDE

Tons

Marlboro

6,000

Freehold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

6,000

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid*

33

PRE-MIXED 75%
COARSE SAND

Tons

Marlboro

2,500

Freechold Borough

Freehold Township

Manalapan

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid*

34

RESERVED

35

RESERVED

36

RESERVED

37

RESERVED

38

RESERVED

39

RESERVED

40

RESERVED




Bid 2022B - WMPG -
Various Road and

Walter R. Earle Corp

Stavola Construction Materials, Inc.

American Bituminous Company Inc.

Trap Rock Industries LLC

1800 Route 34, Bld 2, Suite 205

175 Drift Road

100 Main Street

PO Box 419

Wall, NJ 07719

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

West Collingswood Hgts, NJ 08059

Kingston, NJ 08528

Will not extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

Will extend to other members

@O)] E)QTY x (E) QTY x (E) QTY x (E) QTY x
DESCRIPTION- (A)|(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. TOTAL TOTAL| (B) UNIT| (C)DEL. 131\;?1};‘?; TOTAL|(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. ]%I\;Egg?; TOTAL|(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. 131\;?1};‘?; TOTAL
# |MATERIALS TO BE| | UNIT EST BID PRICE| UNIT BID| BID INCL BID PRICE m BID INCL BID PRICE m BID INCL BID PRICE m BID INCL
DELIVERED QTY| PRICE*|PER UNIT PRICE| DELIVERY| PRICE*|PER UNIT W DELIVER| PRICE*|(PER UNIT W DELIVER| PRICE*|PER UNIT W DELIVER
(B+C) (AxD) Y (AxD) Y (AxD) Y (AxD)
RECYCLED
CONCRETE
41A|AGGREGATE Tons
Marlboro 1,500 - - - $7.75 $24.75] $37,125.00 - - - - - -
Freehold Borough . - - - - - - . - - - - - - -
Freehold Township 7000 "o Bid - } } $17.00 $8.25 $25.25] $25.250.00] ° Bid - - - No Bid } } }
Manalapan 500 - - - $8.00 $25.00] $12,500.00 - - - - - -
RECYCLED
CONCRETE
41B|AGGREGATE, 3” Tons
Marlboro 500 - - - - - - - - - - - -
Freehold Borough . - - - . - - - . - - - - - - -
Freehold Township No Bid - - - No Bid - - - No Bid - - - No Bid - - -
Manalapan - - - - - - - - - - - -
4213/4” CLEAN STONE|| Tons
Marlboro 500 - - - $7.75 $30.75] $15,375.00 - - - - - -
Freehold Borough . - - - $8.25 $31.25 - . - - - ik - - -
Freehold Township 500 Vo Bid - } } $23.00 $8.25 $31.25] $15.625.00 "° Bid - - - No Bid } } }
Manalapan 500 - - - $8.00 $31.00] $15,500.00 - - - - - -
43[STONE DUST Tons
Marlboro 500 - - - $7.75 $30.75] $15,375.00 - - - - - -
Freehold Borough . - - - $8.25 $31.25 - . - - - - - - -
Freehold Township 500] o Bid . ; ; $23.00 $8.25 $31.25] 515.625.00] \° Bid . . . No Bid ; ; ;
Manalapan 2,000 - - - $8.00 $31.00] $62,000.00 - - - - - -




Bid 2022B - WMPG - Walter R. Earle Corp Stavola Construction Materials, Inc. American Bituminous Company Inc. Trap Rock Industries LLC
Various Road and 1800 Route 34, BId 2, Suite 205 175 Drift Road 100 Main Street PO Box 419
Wall, NJ 07719 Tinton Falls, NJ 07724 West Collingswood Hgts, NJ 08059 Kingston, NJ 08528
Will not extend to other members Will extend to other members Will extend to other members Will extend to other members
(D)| (E)QTY x (E) QTY x (E) QTY x (E) QTY x
DESCRIPTION- (A)|(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. TOTAL TOTAL/| (B) UNIT| (C)DEL. (%)N% TOTAL|(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. @U% TOTAL|(B) UNIT| (C)DEL. (%)N% TOTAL
# |MATERIALS TO BE|| UNIT| EST BID PRICE| UNIT BID| BID INCL BID PRICE m BID INCL BID PRICE m BID INCL BID PRICE m BID INCL
DELIVERED QTY| PRICE*|PER UNIT PRICE| DELIVERY| PRICE*|PER UNIT W DELIVER| PRICE*|PER UNIT W DELIVER| PRICE*|PER UNIT W DELIVER
(B+C) (AxD) Y (AxD) Y (AxD) Y (AxD)
DENSE GRADED
AGGREGATE
44|BASE COURSE Tons
Marlboro - - - $7.75 $30.75 - - - - - - -
Freehold Borough . - - - $8.25 $31.25 - . - - - . - - -
Freehold Townsziip T000] Mo Bid - } } $23.00 $8.25 $31.25] 53125000 "° Bid - - - No Bid* } } }
Manalapan - - - $8.00 $31.00 - - - - - - -

* Last two pages of Form B were not included in
submission



