
Marlboro Township
Bid #2021-06 Chemicals
Wednesday, March 10, 2021 @ 10:00AM

Contract Chemical Name

Est. 
Annual    
Qty. Unit

1A Zinc Orthophosphate 90,000 lbs.

1B Sodium Hypochlorite 90,000 gals.

1C Sodium Hydroxide 125,000 gals.

Contract

Swim/Aquatic 
Center Pool 
Chemicals

Est. 
Weekly 
Qty. Unit

1D-1 Sodium Hypochlorite 750 gal. 1.336 1,002.00 1.37 1,027.50
1D-2 Sodium Bicarbonate 10 bags 28.25 282.50 21.00 210.00
1D-3 Calcium Chloride 10 bags 25.25 252.50 18.75 187.50
1D-4 Sodium Thiosulfate 2 bags 49.99 99.98 38.50 77.00

Est. Weekly Total 1,636.98 1,502.00

Est. Pool Season 16 wks 26,191.68 24,032.00

Shannon Chemical 
Corporation          Post 
Office Box 376                 
Malvern, PA 19355

No Bid

75,330.00

342,500.00

No Bid

120,240.00

Shannon Chemical 
Corporation          Post 
Office Box 376                 
Malvern, PA 19355

No Bid

Miracle Chemical Co.              
1151B Highway 33                                   
Farmingdale, NJ 07727

Main Pool and Chemical 
Co Inc.                                          
110 Commerce Road                                                            
Dupont, PA 18641

No Bid

123,300.00

Miracle Chemical Co.                   
1151B Highway 33                                   
Farmingdale, NJ 07727

Main Pool and Chemical 
Co Inc.                                          
110 Commerce Road                                                            
Dupont, PA 18641

Kuehne Chemical 
Company, Inc.                                                        
86 N. Hackensack Ave.                                      
South Kearny, NJ 07032

147,500.00No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Coyne Chemical                                
3015 State Road                                
Croydon, PA 19021

Kuehne Chemical 
Company, Inc.                                                        
86 N. Hackensack Ave.                                      
South Kearny, NJ 07032

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Coyne Chemical                                
3015 State Road                                
Croydon, PA 19021

71,757.00

175,644.00

234,037.50

3/11/2021 2021-06 Chemicals (5 Proposals)


