Marlboro Township

Bid #2023-07 Snow Removal Services
Bid Opening: Tues., May 23, 2023 @ 10:00 AM

BASE BID
Bidder

L.J. Pesce, LLC
100 Igoe Road
Morganville, NJ 07751

Tri County Turf, LLC
81 John White Road
Cranbury, NJ 08512

ALTERNATE BID #2
Bidder

L.J. Pesce, LLC
100 Igoe Road
Morganville, NJ 07751

Tri County Turf, LLC
81 John White Road
Cranbury, NJ 08512

Vehicle
Desc.

Class 1
Class 2
Class 3

Class 1
Class 2
Class 3

Vehicle
Desc.

Class 1
Class 2
Class 3

Class 1
Class 2
Class 3

No Set up Fee/Hourly Rate Only

# of Vehicles

16
No Bid

Set up Fee + Hourly Rate

# of Vehicles Set up Fee
(per vehicle)
2 $3,300.00
4 $3,300.00
2 No Bid
16 $3,500.00
No Bid No Bid
3 No Bid

Equipment Cost
(per vehicle hour)
$305.00
$305.00
$260.00

$289.00
No Bid
$158.00

TOTAL SET UP FEE Equipment Cost
(per vehicle hour)

$6,600.00 $220.00
$13,200.00 $220.00

No Bid $200.00
$56,000.00 $289.00

No Bid No Bid

No Bid $158.00
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Labor Cost
(per vehicle hour)
$60.00
$60.00
$50.00

$75.00
No Bid
$60.00

Labor Cost
(per vehicle hour)
$60.00
$60.00
$50.00

$75.00
No Bid
$60.00

Fuel Cost
(per vehicle hour)
$35.00
$35.00
$25.00

$30.00
No Bid
$30.00

Fuel Cost
(per vehicle hour)
$35.00
$35.00
$25.00

$30.00
No Bid
$30.00

Insurance Cost
(per vehicle hour)
$25.00
$25.00
$15.00

$166.00
No Bid
$40.00

Insurance Cost
(per vehicle hour)
$25.00
$25.00
$15.00

$9.00
No Bid
$40.00

TOTAL RATE
(per vehicle hour)
$425.00 /hr
$425.00 /hr
$350.00 /hr
$560.00 /hr
No Bid /hr
$288.00 /hr
TOTAL RATE
(per vehicle hour)
$340.00 /hr
$340.00 /hr
$290.00 /hr
$403.00 /hr
No Bid /hr
$288.00 /hr



