Marlboro Township
Bid #2024-01B Chemicals
Wednesday, March 6, 2024 @ 11:00AM

Main Pool and Chemical Co

Inc.

Miracle Chemical Co.
1151B Highway 33

Univar Solutions USA, LLC
200 Dean Sievers Place

Est. Annual 110 Commerce Road Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Morrisville, PA 19067
Contract Chemical Name aty. Dupont, PA 18641
Unit
1B Sodium Hypochlorite 25,000 |gals. 3.63 90,750.00 5.77| 144,250 3.29 82,250.00
1C Sodium Hydroxide 75,000 |gals. 2.12 159,000.00 No Bid 3.49 261,750.00
Est. Annual Total 249,750.00 144,250.00 344,000
Main Pool and Chemical Co [Miracle Chemical Co. Univar Solutions USA, LLC
Swim/Aquatic Est. Weekly Inc. 1151? Highway 33 200 I?ea.n Sievers Place
Center Pool .Qty 110 Commerce Road Farmingdale, NJ 07727 Morrisville, PA 19067
Chemicals ) Dupont, PA 18641
Contract Unit
1D-1 Sodium Hypochlorite 750 gal. 3.93 2,947.50 7.77 5,827.50 No Bid No Bid
1D-2 Sodium Bicarbonate 10 bags 37.50 375.00 45.00 450.00 No Bid No Bid
1D-3 Calcium Chloride 10 bags 25.00 250.00 45.00 450.00 No Bid No Bid
1D-4 Sodium Thiosulfate 2 bags 45.00 90.00 75.00 150.00 No Bid No Bid
Est. Weekly Total 3,662.50 6,877.50
Swim Club Pool Est.
Chemical Total Seasonal
Usage for 16 Weeks Qty.
1D-1 Sodium Hypochlorite 11,200 |gal. 3.93 44,016.00 7.77 87,024.00 No Bid No Bid
1D-2 Sodium Bicarbonate 160 bags 37.50 6,000.00 45.00 7,200.00 No Bid No Bid
1D-3 Calcium Chloride 160 bags 25.00 4,000.00 45.00 7,200.00 No Bid No Bid
1D-4 Sodium Thiosulfate 32 bags 45.00 1,440.00 75.00 2,400.00 No Bid No Bid
Est. Pool Season 16 wks 55,456.00 103,824.00
Aquatic Center Pool Est.
Chemical Total Seasonal
Usage for 7 Weeks Qty.
1D-1 Sodium Hypochlorite 1,750 gals 3.93 6,877.50 7.77 13,597.50 No Bid No Bid
1D-2 Sodium Bicarbonate 70 bags 37.50 2,625.00 45.00 3,150.00 No Bid No Bid
1D-3 Calcium Chloride 70 bags 25.00 1,750.00 45.00 3,150.00 No Bid No Bid
1D-4 Sodium Thiosulfate 14 bags 45.00 630.00 75.00 1,050.00 No Bid No Bid
Est. Pool Season 7 wks 11,882.50 20,947.50




